
h%
Cil/I
clalztREPUBLIC OF KENYA

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

THIRTEENTH PARLIAMENT - SECOND SESSION - 2023

DIRECTORATE OF DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEES

DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON TRADE, INDUSTRY AND COOPERATIVES

REPORT ON THE STATUTE LAW (MISCELLANEOUS AMENDMENTS) BrLL (NATIONAL
ASSEMBLY BtLL NO.67 OF 2023)

'i 'i,-i ::. i..t,.- - r .

f'*T,: lx Fia 2i+

I
;

t(t t 't ?-bri

t
(

,(

Published by:
The Directorate of Departmental Committees
Clerk's Chambers
Parliament Buildings
NAIROBI

February 2024



Table of Contents
LIST OFANNEXURES
CHAIRPERSON'S FOREWORI)
CHAPTER ONE
1.0 PREFACE
1.1 lntroduction

1.2 Establishment and Mandate of the Committee

1.3 CommitteeMembership

1.4 Committee Secretariat

CHAPTER TWO
2.0 PUBLIC PARTICIPATION/ STAKEHOLDERS CONSULTATION

CHAPTER THREE
3.0 ANALYSIS OF THE PROPOSED AMENDMENTS

3.1 Amendments to the Scrap Metal Act

1.4 Submissions by the Consumer Federation of Kenya (COFEK)

1.5 CommitteeObservations

CHAPTER FOUR
CHAPTER FIVE
COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATIONS

3

4
5

5

5

5

6

7

8
8

o

9

10

11

l3
l4
t4

1



LIST OFANNEXURES

1. Report Adoptron Schedule
2. Commrttee Mlnutes
3. Copy of Newspaper Advert
4. Letter Seekrng Stakeholders Submissrons

5. Submrssrons by Stakeholders

3



CHAIRPERSON'S FOREWORD

This report details the consideration by the Departmental Committee on Trade, Industry and
Cooperatives of the Statute Law (Miscellaneous Amendments) Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 67 of
2023). The Bil[ seeks to amend various statutes among them The Scrap Metal Act, No I of 2015 which
is relevant to the Departmental Committee on Trade Industry and Cooperatives.

The Bill was published on 30'r'October 2023 and read a First Time in the House on l5'h November,2023
It was thereafter committed to various relevant Departmental Committees for consideration and
reporting to the House pursuant to the provision of Standing Order 12'7.

Article I l8(l) (b) of the Constitution and Standing Order 127(3) require Parliament to facilitate public
participation and involvement in the legislative and other business of Parliament and its Committees. In
compliance with the foregoing, the Committee, through the placement of adverts in the print media on
l7'n Novcmber, 2023 (Anncx 3), invited the public and interested stakeholders to submit mcmoranda on
the proposed amendment.

From the foregoing, the Committee receivcd views from the various stakeholders and thereafter held
meetings with the stakeholders where submissions were received and the presentations considered
before adoption of this report. Having considcrcd the proposcd amendments and based on analysis of
submissions, the Committce madc observations for cach of thc proposed amendnrents The Scrap Metal
Act, No I of20l5 as contained in Part IV of this Report.

Having reviewed the proposed amendments to the Scrap Metal Act, No I of 2015, as contained in the
Statute Law (Miscellaneous Amendments) Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 60 of 2O22), the Committee
recommends THAT the proposed amendments to the Scrap Metal Act,2015 should not proceed but
should be put on hold pending further review, wider stakeholder consultations and submission of a

comprehensive bill to review the entire Scrap Metal Act.

Hon. James Mwangi Gakuya, M.P.
Departmental Committee on Trade, Industry and Cooperatives

4



CHAPTER ONE

l.OPREFACE

1.1 lntroduction

1. This report details the consideration by the Departmental Committee on Trade, lndustry
and Cooperatives of the Statute Law (Miscellaneous Amendments) Bill (National Assembly
Bill No. 67 of 2023).

2. The Bill was published on 30'n October 2023 and read a First Time in the House on 15th
November, 2022. lt was thereafter committed to various Departmental Committees for
consideration and reporting to the House pursuant to the provision of Standing Order 127.
Specifically, the Committee considered amendments proposed to the The Scrap Metal
Act, No 1 of 2015.

1.2 Establishment and Mandate of the Committee
3. The Departmental Committee on Trade, Industry and Cooperatives is one of the Departmental

Committees of the National Assembly established under Standing Order 216. The functions
and mandate of the Committee include, among others, "to study and review all legislation referred
to it".

4. ln accordance with the Second Schedule of the Standing Orders, the Committee is
mandated to consider, Trade, including securities exchange, consumer protection, pricing
policies, commerce, ind ustrialization including special economic zones, enterprise
promotion and development, Micro, small &and; medium enterprise (MSMEs), and small
and medium enterprise (SMEs), intellectual property, industry standards, anti-counterfeit
and cooperative development.

ln executing its mandate, the Committee oversees the Ministry of lnvestment, Trade and
lndustry and the Ministry of Cooperatives and Micro, Medium and Small Enterprises (MSMES)

5



1.3 Committee Membership

5. The Departmental Committee on Trade lndustry and Cooperatives was constituted by the
House on Thursday, 27th October 2022 and comprises the following Members:

Chairperson
Hon. James Mwangi Gakuya, MP

Embakasi North Constituency
UDA Partv

Vice-Chairperson
Hon Kitany Jebet Marianne, MP

Aldai Constituency
UDA Partv

Members
Hon. Dr. Oundo Wilberforce Ojiambo, MP
Funyula Constutiency
ODM Party

Hon. Adagala Beatrice Kahai, MP
Vihiga Constituency
ANC Partv

Hon. Korir Adams Kipsanai, MP
Keiyo North Constituency
UDA Party

Hon. Githinji Robert Gichimu, MP
Gichugu Constituency
UDA Party

Hon. Hassan Kulow Maalim, MP
Banissa Constituency
UDM Party

Hon. Kamene Joyce, MP
Machakos Constituency
WDM Partv

Hon. Mwalyo Joshua Mbithi, MP
Masinga Constituency
lndependent Member

Hon. Oluoch Anthony, MP
Mathare Constituency
ODM Party

Hon. Guyo Adhe Wario, MP
North Horr Constituency
KANU Party

Hon. Maina Mwago Amos, MP
Starehe
JP Partv

Hon. Sakimba Parashina Samwel, MP
Kajiado South Constituency
ODM Party

Hon. Wanaina Antony Njoroge, MP
Kieni Constituency
UDA Party

Hon. Waithaka John Machua
Kiambu Constituency
UDA Partv

6



1.4 CommlfteeSecretariat
6, The Committee is facilitated by the following staff:

Rose Mudibo
Senlor Clerk Assistant /Head of Secretarlat

Mr. Ellam Omuhinda
Clerk Asslstant lll

Ms. Doreen Karani
Senlor Legal Counsol

Ms. Loice Olesia
FIscal Analyst lll

Ms. Mercy Mayende
Media Relations Offlcer

Mr. Onesmus Kiragu
rgeant-At-Arms

r. Benjamin Ochutsi
ansard Officer

Ms. Evelyn Kerubo Orina
Glerk Asslstant lll

Mr. Peter Barasa
Legal Counsel ll

Mr. Arkan Ali Mumin
Research Offlcer lll

Mr. Josphat Bundotich
Senior Sergeant-At-Arms

Mr. Cosmas Akhonya
Audlo Recordlng Officer

Ms. Pricillah Saidi
Reeearch Officer lll

7



CHAPTER TWO
2,0 PU BLIC PARTICIPATION/ STAKEHOLDERS CONSU LTATION
7. Article 118(1) (b) of the Constitution and Standing Order 127(3) require Parliament to

facilitate public participation and involvement in the legislative and other business of
Parliament and its Committees. ln compliance with the foregoing, the Committee,
through the placement of adverts in the print media on 166 December,2022 (Annex
3), invited the public and interested stakeholders to submit memoranda on the
proposed amendment.

8. Through the placement of adverts in the print media on 17b November, 2023 (Annex
3), invited the public and interested stakeholders to submit memoranda on the
proposed amendment.

9. Submissions (Annex 4) were received from the following stakeholders-

(a) Consumer Federation of Kenya;
(b) Ministry of lnvestments, Trade and lndustry;
(c) Scrap Metal Council.

10. The analysis of the submissions made by the stakeholders are contained in Chapter three

8



CHAPTER THREE
3.0 ANALYSIS OF THE PROPOSED AMENDMENTS

I l. The Bill in particular proposes several amendments to The Scrap Metal Act, No I of 2015.

12. The following is an analysis of the proposed amendments and the submissions
made by various stakeholders on each ofthe proposed amendments:

3.1 Amendments to the Scrap Metal Act
13. The Bill proposes to amend the Scrap Metal Act in section 2 by inserting the

following new definitions in proper alphabetical sequence-

"Authority" means the Kenya Revenue Authority established under section 3 of the
Kenya Revenue Authority Act

"critical national infrastructure" means physical and virtual assets or facilities,
whether owned by private or public entities which are essential to the provision of
vital services to the public for their social and economic wellbeing, and which if
destroyed, degraded or rendered unavailable, would impact on the social or
economic wellbeing of the nation or affect the government's ability to undertake
national defence and security;

"electrical rewinder" means a person who deals in the repair or rewinding of electric
motors;

"smelter" means an installation or factory for smelting metal from its ore or means a
person engaged in the business of smelting"; and

"steel fabricators" means an installation or factory for the production of metal
structures using a range of processes such as cutting, bending or assembling, which
generates scrap metal in their processes.

14.The Bill proposes amendment to section 4(1Xf)(i) by deleting the word "the" and
substituting the same with the word "a"

The Bill proposes amendment to section +(t)(f)(v) by deleting the aforementioned
section.

'15.The Bill proposes amendment to section 6(1Xa)(ii) by deleting the word "utility" and
substituting the same with the words "critical national"

16.The Bill proposes amendment to section 9(1) by inserting the word "a" immediately
after the word "of'

9



1 7. The Bill proposes amendment to section 11 by renumbering the provisions as
subsection (1) and adding the following-

(2) Notwithstanding subsection (1) the Cabinet Secretary shall issue a special
license for dealing in copper, aluminum and their alloys.

(3) An application for a special license shall be made in accordance with section
10.

18.The Bill proposes amendment to sectionl8(3) (a) by deleting the word "one million"
and substituting the therefor the words "five million". The Bill proposes amendment
to sectionl8(3) (b) by deleting the word "five" and substituting the therefor the word
"ten"

19.The Bill proposes amendment to section 20(a) by deleting the word "one" and
substituting the therefor the word "five"

20.The Bill proposes amendment to section22(2) by deleting the words "one million"
and substituting the therefor the words "five million"

21.The Bill proposes amendment to section 24 by inserting the words "critical national"
immediately after the word "the". Further the Bill proposes amendment to section 24
by inserting new section immediately after section (1) -

(1A) A state entity responsible for critical national infrastructure shall dispose crap
metal from critical national infrastructure to the numerical machining complect to the
Kenya Ship yard limited for smelting into billets.

(1B) Where there is inadequate capacity at the numerical machining complex and
Kenya Shipping yard limited, the respective state entity through a written consent
from numerical machining complex and Kenya Shipping yard limited, shall seek
approval from the counsel to partner with a local smelter directly without involving a
broker.

The Bill proposes amendmenl to section24(2) by deleting the word "ten" and
substituting the therefor the words "twenty"

The Bill further proposes amendment to section24(2) by deleting the word "three" and
substituting the therefor the words "seven"

22. The Bill proposes amendment to section26(1 ) by inserting the words "or import"
immediately after the word "export"

The Bill proposes amendment to section26(3) by inserting the words "in consultation
with the authority" immediately after the word "Secretary"

The Bill further proposes amendment to section26 by inserting the following new
subsection section immediately after sub section (3)-

(3A) The certificate issued under subsection (3) shall indicate the nature, quantity
and consideration for scrap metal to ensure compliance with the approved limits.

10



23.The Bill proposes amendment to section3O(a) by inserting the words "critical national"
immediately after the word "vandalized"

The Bill proposes amendment to section 30(1)(e)(ii) by inserting the words "smelter,

electrical rewinder, steel fabricator" immediately after the word "miller"

1.4 Submissions by the Consumer Federation of Kenya (COFEK)

24.fhe Federation was opposed to the amendments for the following reasons-

a. That the proposed amendments are strange to Scrap Metal Council and
offend the provisions of section 32 of the Scrap Metal Act as the remail
proceeds of fraudulent process and one which impersonates the council
for selfish gains of unnamed cartels.

b. That republication of the amendments under the ministry of lnvestment
Trade lndustry is in itself a confirmation that the amendments are stale,
illegal, unprocedural and do not relate to the ministry of lnvestment, Trade
and lndustry and as such should not be used in the house.

c. That the amendments shall occasion violation of the constitution either
through form or content.

d. That removal of a council /Board, in light with the consumer rights under
article 46 of the constitution cannot be through miscellaneous
amendments but should be through a substantive amendment of the
parent Act.

e. That the Cabinet Secretary has acted beyond the power/mandate
bestowed upon the office in coming up with the aforementioned
amendments.

f. That the proposed amendments offend the provisions of Article 1(1) and
10 of the constitution. By seeking to remove consumer federation of the
Kenya from the scrap metal council without following due procedure
intends to offend the provisions of Article 27(40, 47 and 50 of the
constitution of Kenya.

g. That the amendments seek to amend other legislations such as the
Numerical Machining and Kenyan Shipyard through the Scrap Metal Act,
2015.This should only be done through a substantive amendment and not
the miscellaneous amendment.

h. The purpose rationale for Miscellaneous Amendments as was observed
in Law Society of Kenya & Another (2016) e KLR, by the five judge bench
is, 'it is fherefo re clear that both on policy and good governance, which is
one of the values and principles of governance in Articb 10 of the

Constitution, which values and principles form the foundation of our State
and Nation as decreed in Afticle aQ) of the Constitution, omnibus
amendments in the form of Statute Law Miscellaneous legislations ought
to be confined only to minor non-controversial and generally house-
keeping amendments.

t7



i.'the practice in the United States of America as stated by Louis Massicofte,
is varied with some states permitting omnibus bills and other resticting
bills to a srng/e rssue. ln a 190'l American case of Commonwealth vs.
Barnett (199 US. 161) the court stated that: "Bills, popularly called
omnibus bills, became a crying evil, not only from the confusion and
distraction of the legislative mind by the jumbling together of incongruous
subT'ecfs, but still more by the facility they afforded to corrupt combinations
of minorities with different rnterests to force lhe passage of bills with
provisions which could never succeed if they stood on their separate
merits".

1.5 Committee Observations
25. The amendments proposed are new definitions under section 2. These

terminologies proposed in the Bill to be inserted as amendments are neither used
anywhere in the Scrap Metal Act nor are they proposed to be included within the
body of the Act.

26. Further, the Committee observed the new amendments are inadmissible as they
expand the subject of the Bill contrary to Standing Order 133(5). That the committee
would require more time to scrutinize and conduct stakeholders' engagement in
order to make a consideration on the aforementioned proposed amendments.

27. The committee observed that there has been inadequate stakeholders' engagement
who had presented submissions and the only stakeholder who has presented their
memoranda opposed to the amendments and the Committee therefore seek more
time to scrutinize the Bill in order advice on whether the Scrap Metal Act should be
amended through a miscellaneous amendment or through introduction of a
comprehensive amendment Bill to the Scrap Metal Act

L2



CHAPTER FOUR
4.0 COMMITTEE OBSERVATIONS

28. Having considered the proposed amendments, the Committee observed THAT

The Scrap Metal Act

(1 ) The amendments proposed are new definitions under section 2. These
terminologies proposed in the Bill to be inserted as amendments are neither used
anywhere in the Scrap Metal Act nor are they proposed to be included within the
body of the Act.

(2) Further, the Committee observed the new amendments are inadmissible as they
expand the subject of the Bill contrary to Standing Order 133(5). That the
committee would require more time to scrutinize and conduct stakeholders'
engagement in order to make a consideration on the aforementioned proposed
amendments.

(3) The committee observed that there has been inadequate stakeholders'
engagement who had presented submissions and that the only stakeholder who
presented their memoranda was opposed to the amendments and the
Committee therefore seek more time to scrutinize the Bill in order advice on
whether the Scrap Metal Act should be amended through a miscellaneous
amendment or through introduction of a comprehensive amendment Bill to the
Scrap Metal Act.

I

13



l

I

{o
lg.
I

Rf,'IVE

MMITTEE RECOMMENDATIONS

Pursuant to Standing Order 127, the Committee recommends:

(a) THAT with respect to amendmerts to the Scrap Metel Acg the Schedule to the Bill be
amended by deleting ALL the proposed amendments.

) & /**<
Hon. James Gakuye, M.P.

Departmental Committee on Thade, Industry end Cooperatives

?
Afl"---,,

t.,

i:; t
!{,c{&

THE NATIC)T{AI ASSEMI}I-Y
PAI,ER-q I-AIf)

DATE: IlFEB2023 OAY.

TABi-ED
BY:

n
u l'{!

(D.,1,

CL},RI(.AT
'rH.€ 'I',.\$LB:

a

L4



Consumers Federation of Kenya
llclr.nr,t I'l.r( r, lllrr L l 4\,
Nn(!nfl ll(URin8 llrl hrftrr!,1n1 ,

n() llo\ 2t{01I 00)00

N.rtr trbi

( r.ll | )',4 ll1'.ii,""O.ol I ll800o8,
t mntl holLnrrn)(of,tt ,fti..1

: admrn@cofel to ln
lvttll @Colet -ehrn
Wctr. vrvrvr <ole!.altrca

(,
Colok

N,'rtrrrl'r'r 1.1, 202 1

llon lr'[ores lr{. \Vctang'rrln
St'cakcr
National Asscntbll'
I)arlianrcnt llrrildings
NAIROBr cl,;,- o19

cD&
1

I

on c

L)cirr Sir, +, 6o-
Lzq.

.J:.

RE: REOU[^ST TO EXPUNGE PUITPORTET)

ur-9 llr:.fz 3."J),*,."*.

0a
t

CRAP MF-TAL

a

ACT. 2OI5 CONTAINED WITHIN MI ELTANEOI IS AMFNDlvlENTBILL LOLl

rWc lrr'r,,'h1 u'ritc trr rlrau,y<rrtr kintl rttcntion t() (rrrr gravr'conccrn ilt thc pcrsistunt irnd mostly

frarrdttlcnt nxl'rs bcing rrscd hy cirrtt'ls to rcnlov(. thc Consrrnrt'rs Fctlcrirtion of Kcnl'l
(COFIIK) fronr thc Scrlp Mcrrrl Council tlrrough illcgirl, r,cxirtiotts irn(l r:()ntL'mJrttl()rts

, nrcntlmcnrs lo thr' Act.

Thc latcst srrch lrid is lnothcr hr.rrricd attcmpt t() rrsc crror-ritltlen Miscellanqotts Amcndmt-nt

Rill ns publishc'd on Octobcr 10, 2021. l-lrc Govcrnment Printcr and or thc rel(-\'lnt

Comnrittc,.' knos's or ortght to know that tlrc originating Ministrl' o[ lnvcstmcnts, Trlld(- xnd

Indrrsrq'(MlTt) vr'rbirlly disou'ncd tlrc rccommcndntions t1'thcir predcccssor (Ministrl oI
lndusrrialization, 'frad.' arrd Entcrprise Dcvclopmcnt - MITED) sncakctl into thc

Misccllnncotrs Anrcntlnrcnt Ritl, 2022 on scrlp Mctal Act, 2015. Satl. To slro!\' th.' scrL' ,.rf tlrc

stinking sc;rnr lx-twe'cn tlrc Attorn..y Ccncrll and Covcrnnrent Printcr, srrmcont' rcputtlisht'cl

thc MITED pr.rposirls - u'ltcn th,.' Ministry is nou' MlTl.

Tlrt'nrovc by MlTl on MlTliD offending rcc.rmmcnclations mc'ant thcrr'rvas ncithcr

stakch6[cr/prrblic participation thrt coul.l havc procct'tlcd. Thcy collaps.'tl sint'tlit'. Thcy rvcrt'

ncvcr nlcilnt to [)c rrscuscitiltctl in tlrc fornr nn(l Contctlt - cxccpt \\'ith tht'cxprr'ss concutr!'ncc

of thc' Scrap Mctrl (lotrncil antl thc Catrinct Sccrctirrl', MITI as pcr provisi!)ns of Scctiorr J2 of
rhc Scrap Mt'rll Act, 201 5. Ncvcr mintl tlut in thc contitrttt'tl nrts('ttcc of thc o(f,"nding

prrrportc(l anrcntlnrcnts risk rhc lcgality antl or coustittt(ionaliq' of thc cntirt' Bill' as thcrc is

no Ministrf in Kenyl nou'clll Mll'[iD

Accorilingly, wc writc to scck yottr.'nrly , i n.l ivi.lrral, crrllccr ile,rn,,l inrmt'.liatc concu rtcnc!' to

havc thc said nnrcudmcnts tottchirrg ott Scrnp Mct,rl )'r s rally

cxprrngcd from htcst " M iscclla trtotrs Anrctrtlm htJ,Bi
"Misccllnncous" in any rcspcct. Ortr consitlt'rct rcque

1.0 Background to Our Casc

L I COFEK is a mcmbcr of thc Scr:rp Mcr.rl Co
Cr.

ncilhs crtabll (v) nnd which
I\l L0nl

ly delctc. rvithout t:asis, rarionolc or

30 Nov 2023

a

,'J UI t r i,'r''

(Dmcct hc thrcshold of
thc foll ing dctails;

Scction thc slid thc offcnding Bill $'ishcs to mlsc levouS

3 0 Nov 2023



cvctt ucc()r(lilrg rr lrcrrrirrg to (l()l:l:K (ontr;rry t() pr()visi(,ns ol Article 47 arrtl 50. It cln only
tltrtlifl'ls tliscrinr irnt itrrr rvlriclr is prohihitrtl tttrtlcr Articlc 2?(4) of(}rK-2010. Tlrc prcscncc of
COI:l:K orr tlrc (lrrrrrreil is criticrrl trr atlrlrc'ss Ittlrlic ittlcrcsr rnirttcrs - pritrcilrrrlly orr

cnvirrrnrrrentirl lrrrl lrcnltlr c1rrrsitlcnrtirrrts - r'spccially ott tttittintizittg tltc rcrtl tl;rngcr of tlrc
ca rc i trtrgt'rr ic nit(u r(' ()[ scrill) tn('titl.

1.2 Untlcr Scgiorr 3, tlrc Scrrgr Mctal (irtrncil(SMC) is a lxrtly corporatc ablc to srrc irnd bc

srrc.l in its' n:rnrc. lt is in clrargc of its' lrrrsincss. Alth<>trgh its' primary rolc is advisory to tlrc CS
f()r lnvcstnrcnts, l'rrdc nnrl ln.lrrstry (Ml'l-l), rrnrlcr Scction 32 nnd on all occasions - it initiatcs
ldvisrrrics Srro Moto to tlrc CS. lt is ncvcr t,icc versa

1.3 [rr ttrrcxl'laincrl anrl rvr.rng nl()v(' corlrrary to Parrgraph ( L2) hercin abovc, thc fornrcr
Cabinct Sr.crctary for Mirristry o[ lnrlustry an(l Tradc and Ilntcrprisc Dcvclopmcnt (MITED)
Ms Dctty Maiur, u'orking in cahoots with othcr forccs cxccpt tlrc Scrap Mctal Cotrncil,
foru,ardctl lrcr r.crsion os,n anrcrrdnrcnts t() thc. Act as rvcll ns Rcgtrlations ptrrporting ro amcnd
ancl to ope'r'irtionalizc tlrc Scrap Mctal Act, 2015. Thcy wcrc ncvcr processcd lly SMC

1.4 Roth hcr Amt'udmcnts and hcr proposctl Rcgrrlations wcrc rlcfcatcd, Wc rcfcr to thcm as

"hcr Amcndntcnts" Lrccrrrsc thcy u'r.'rc ncitlrcr irritiatcrl by:rny formal mccting of thc Scrap

Mt'tal Corrncil nor \\'cr!r thc)', nt arr)'pt.lint, ratificrl lrl,tlrc sanrc Scrap Mctal Council - to which
\tr'c flrc rcPr('scntcd.

1,5 ln rejccting thc Rcgrrlations thc'liorrsc Committcc on Dclcgatcd lrgislation rhcn lcd b1

Hon Kassait Kamkct ol,scn'.'d in part, thrrs;

1.5.1 Contrary to Arriclc 10, CoK20l0 as rcatl togcthcr with Scc. 5A ofthc Sratrrrory
Insrrumens Act of 20l3, thcr('no dcmonsmation at alt of prrblic participation in thc proccss of
nlaking rcgulation. [n anl casc, it u'as only SMC that would hlvc rtntlcrtaken thc prrtrlic
participatiotl.

1.5.2 Thc Comnrinr.,c also obscn'cd that contrnry to Scctions 6,7,8 and 9 of thr-' Stnttrtoq'
lnsrrumcnts Acr, 2013 thcre u'as no rcgtrlatory inrPact irsscssnrc'nt strbnrimcd. This sorrkl ncvcr
havc. bccn possilrlc corrsidcring that no stakcholtl,'r rnrl prrtrlic pilrticipition harl hcn
condrrctcd.

[.5.3 For avoidance. of tkrrrbt Ms Maina's RcgLrlations anrl Amcntlmeuts ncv!'r ha(l n sratcmcrlr
on the proof an(l dcntorrsrirriorr that sufficic'nt pu[)lic consultation s as/harl l,ccn condrrct,..rl ls
rcqu ired tt ndcr Articlcs l0 a nd I l8 of tlrc Ootrstitution; Also missing rvcrt' - A trricf stltc'mcnt
of all thc consultations rrndcrtirkcn llcfore thc' stirtutory insffumcnt sas mirdc; A l)ri('f
statcntcnt of thc way thc consrrltirtion wirs carricdi an outlinc of thc rr'sttlts of thc consultation;
a lrricf cxplanarion of lrry changr's nrrrlr to thc lcgislntion :rs a rcstrlt of thc consulmtion antl
worsc, thc rcgLr lntion-nraking iluthority cntity failcd to cxplain rvhy no such consultation was

unJertakcn.

1.6 COFEK pr'titioncd lxrth thc l]orrsc and the High Court. The Housc garc rcpricvc. COFEK
latcr s'ithrlrcrv thc Pt,tirion ar rlrc H igh Court (E I 5 I of 2021). This follo*.cd thc rcrluest by thc
Cabinet Sccretary for Ministq,of Invcstmcnts, Trade and Indusrq (MITI) rlirectly (Mr Mosr's
Ktrria) and from lndustq' Principal Sccrerary Dr Juma Mukhrvana. to thc rrndcrsigncd. 1'hc

t



l't'tiliott rr',r,' s illrrlr.ru rr s itlrorrt rlrrr. r o.lr orr tlrr. lrrrIcr.t,rn,Iittt{ llt,tt lrtt lt l';rrl}'u('ul(l l'(,:rr iti'
((r\l\.'l ll( \'illrrlt,rs,rl tr',,,. t , r t r t | | | i , r t r . r | , rrn illlr{rl! ()ll!'t\,

l.(t.I 'l lrtt lr4ll I rt.,.rll' ,rll ru, lr,,,runrrrli(;rtion.i tlr;rt tvcrt'lrrtrlc lrr lltc cffcrt tlr.rt rlrc
ttrrrlt.rsil:rrr.,l slr,,rrl,l lr.. 1...11111tr1 lrorrr rrrcrulr,.rslrll' rrl tlrt'Sr.lr1' Mlt;rl (ltrrrrrcil (SM(.)

I.h,: l-lr1t Nll'l Ir..i,rlls its'lr(rlir|s(.(l ,rnr.'rrrlnr..nts IoIltt'Ser.tp Mct,tl Acr,20I5 a" eont,rintrl

ill lh(. ('.rrlirl \'(rrirrn (rl-tlr(. lr,lis,.r'llurr,'rrrrs A rut.rrrltrre ltl rrntl trs 1'c1 larv lrc rcfcrrctl rtr tlrt' SM( l

to rlevr.ltrI l.,,rtlr tlre A rlrcrttltrr.'ttl. rtttrl llcgttlatiotts rrs lr('r Sccti(trr 12 of tIrc ScrirI Mctll At r'

l0l s.

l.tr.1 Th rt St'ctirrn I ()f rh(. Scrirl M ctrl Au, 201 5 which pr()vi(lcs that thc Corr ntil isllxrtly
(rrr|(rrirtc lrc r.'arl irr its riglrt{rrl corrtcxt with()ut illty crron('()tts (mis)intcrprct;rti<)n of Secti()r')

7(2) u'lrich has ruutl r. tht' Ministrv t(, tnicr(>nral)n t lrc ()r)crittio ns antl or cvcn nUrD()rt t(l vct\)

rlt'cisir''trs trl' thc SMC

I .(;.4 Tlrur r lc st f ri(rririzc rlclction of tlrc offcrrding Scction ?(2) wltich is oftcn dmivrc:rd t<r

strrrrrrl as if it is conrl',rrlsory frrr MITI to provitlc'sccrr'tariat serviccs'irnd if provision of such

scn'iccs nrc'arrt/nr('ilns thc sccotrtlctl offict-rs answer to thc SMC or thc Miltistry PS or CS.

1 .7 Thar thc l-ICCC E 15l o( 7077 wrs u'itlrtlrawn on thos!' grottrtds. If MITI wcrt' cithcr
nrisclritvotrs and or Covcrnmcnt Printcr rcpublislrcrl thc offcntling Scrap Mctal stalc

lmcndmcrrts in crror, MITI slrotrld and or ought to, havc by now, formally disowncd thc
MITED vcrsion of thc Amcndmcnts. Aftcr all, and savc for doctrinc of pcrpctuity, the' M[T[
tcanl c:rnnot c()nrl)ctcntly rlcfe rrrl thcm. Thcy havc ftrll bricf of thc samc.

2.0 GROUNDS OF OPPOSITION

2. I That thc proposcrl Anrcn.lmcnt.s :rrc r strnngcr to SMC and MlTl and tlffcnd Scction lZ of
thc ScraP Mctal Acr, 202 j ns tlrc1, rcmain proccL'(ls of a frattrlulcrrt proccss irnd onc s,hich
impcrsonatcs thc SMC for sc'lfish gaitrs rrf ttnnante tl crrtcls.

2.2 Carte ls slrorrkl not bc allou,ccl tr.r crrjol, thc procr'crls of a fraurlttlcnt nroc('ss. [n al.r] cirsc,

Parliirnrcnt cirnnor l.lc rhat institrrtion tlrat shotrltl bc usccl ftrr intlividtrals to scftlc tlreir
gricvirnccs antl .lr grcctl.

2. j Thc rcpublication of thc offcnrling Anrcrxlmcnts trntler MITED (instcac{ of MlTl) is in
itsclf a confirmatiorr tlrat they nrc lxrth stnle', illcgrrl, turproccrlttral antl tlo not rclntc to Minisrry
,.lf Invcstnrcnts, Tratlc lrrrl Irrrhrstry arr<l as srrch cirnnot hc rrscrl by the Hottsc. Therc was no
Ministry of Intlrrstry, Trl,.lc antl Urrtcrprisc f)cvcloPnrcnt (MITED) that cxistcd by Octobcr 30,
2023 nor cxists in Kcrrya by rlrlt nirnrc. Ns fl LlwfuI Ministry of thc Bxcctrtivc arm of the
Republic of Kcnya today.

2,4 Thnt frorn Prrngrirplr 2.3, thc slitl Amcnrlnrcnts purporting to nmend thc Scrap Mcral Act,
2015 havc no basis to rcmflirl standing. They mrrst immedi:rtcly foll in their cndrety and thosc
involvcd in thcir frautltrlcnt inclusion brought to book.Thcy havc no fcct to stand unon if thcy
did not, as is clcnrly thc casc, crnanatc from no knorvn Ministry ns pcr public,ltion drtc of tlrc
said Bill.



2.5 That tlrt'offt'ntling inrpttgnctl nntt'udnr,"'nts occitsion violltion of the Constitution cithcr
tlrrouglr fornr arrd corrtcnt. Whcthcr thc violation is one of form or content, any such violatiotr
is sufficicnt for thc l-lonourable Hotrsc Spcaker to find that a proposcd impugncd law is

u nconstinrtional. COFEK is persuadcd tlrat tlrc impugned amenclnr.'nts arc ctltrally nrost

substaltivc in nantrc sincc they rvcrc fashioncd to ovcrhaul tlrc manncr in u'hich affcctctl Acts

6f tfic liru,will opcratc. An cxanrple is tht'purportt'rl, uncxplainc'd, ttnwarrantt'd, mischicvotts,

immoral and trnlarvful l.roposcd rcmoyal of of Consumcrs Fctleradon of Kt'nya (COFEK) from

thc Scrap Courrcil Acr. for sr'lfish intcresm of cartcls witlrin and outsitlc Governmcnt afrrrirl of
thc strictrrcss of thc said COFEK on thc' SMC.

2.5,1 Removll of a Corrncil,/llo:rrtl mcmllcr, in lighr of constittltional cons(tmcr rights nt

Articlt 46 of the Constinrrion, cillln()t lrc 'ir nr isct'lla ncorts' antcttclmcnt lrttt nrost sttbstantivc.

Thc'pirrt-r'rt Act shoultl lr.'anrt'ntlctl. N()t rl nrisccllillcotts amcntlnrcnt

2.5.2 Eren in thc s,.rrst cnsc sccnrrio u,lrcrc it u'crc still to lrc forccd to bc a "misccllirnc'otts

anrctrdmcttt", a rtrgttc lttrtl ()r il c()rrtll)t ():rhinct Sccrctary itntl or hcr:tgcnLs wlro lravc nctcd in

cxccss ,rf lrcr linritcJ pt,rrt'rs to citlrcr (lircc( rlll(l ()r ptlrP()rt t() dircct tlrc Attorncy Ocncral nnrl

or thc Go\.ernnrcnt Print('r, Srro Moto, t,r pttlrlislt ;r []ill ptrrporting rcmovc iln instittttion fronr

1n Act of L1v ,,'stalrlishcd lry I)arliarn,,'nt u'ithottt shou'ing cattsc, sttlrstancc antl trasis - is

trrrrcnabl.' and lt:r.l in larr'.

2.5.1Tlris rlor.rt' inrplics thlt tlrc proposcd amcnclnrcnr is NOT a misccllancotts onc. Itlcirlly

suc6 a1 amcldmcnr if it lrirs gonc rllrough Catrinct will lrt' dcbltcd by thc Housc ancl amcndctl

ncc6rdingll.fronr rlrc contcxt.rf t[c parcnt Act, nr't Ontnilrtts (M isct'llancotrs Bill).

2.5.5 That tlrcrc tlrr' f rc'poscd Anr,.'nd mt'trt.s to tlrc Scrap lv{ct.rl Act, 20 I 5 offcnrl A rticlc I ( I )

.rnd cspccially Arriclc l0 of thc Corrsdnrtion' Ily sccking t(', rcm(\'c COFIIK fronr thc SMC,

ryirhout folkllirrg drrc procc.s, thc proccss and itttcnt <>ffentls Articl.'. 27$1,47 antl 50 t'f th.'

Colstirution of Kcn1,a for u'lrich lrrrth th.' I{otrse Spcrtkcr lntl }vl I's s\\'orr t() prot,,'cr ,ttrtl

rrphold.

2.5.6 That f<rr ntarrl,rcasons rt,rfud hcrt, tltr stule itttrl offcn.ling Amctrrlttrents to tlrc St'r:tp

Mctal Acr, 2015 lrave nor rrrd u,ill n()t undurg() ln1' lirrnr rrf prrtrlic nilrticipation (in tlrrr f<,rrn

an{ c1;nrcnr) as thcl,urc frrrudulcntll'eirrrietl rvitltin tht' }r'l isct'lhncorrs Antcrrtlnrr'nt []ill

2.5.7 Vhcn thc sanrt'Anrcndtnctrts c.rnlc tln lirr ptrblic firticinati()n in latt' l;t'lrrtlirry 2021, at

Windsor Hotcl, nulirobi, rhc tr'llTl olficials lcd 11'l'rincipnl Sccrt'tary [)r Jtrma Mrrkhwan.r

r'.'rllrlly tlisos'n.'tl rlrcm antl inftrrrnetl thc l lousc Conrnrittcc thar thc C<-runcil .*'ill rc<Jrrr ft rht'
Anrcndm!'nts b.'forc thc N'llTI rcsuhnrit" rhr'lrr.

2.4.8 To tlrc lrr:sr rrl rrur,/m1'unde rsrarrding, Jt n() (irnr has SMC tlis.-trsrcd, approvcd dnJ .vcn
f.rrnrc.l ,rn edvi.on ()l)ini()n ()n thc offrnding lmcnrjmcntt ro thc ScrrP Mctll .Act, 2015

l.O Facts o( l-arr

3.I For a long rinrc, s,,.crirrll. t'f thc Exccutivr: hlvc misuscrl thc Pirrli;rmtntary p71v15r 11v gqr.llq
.rl'tt.,,' tlr.' I l(rus(. St:rtutu l-ru N'li.ccllanc.,rrs Amcndmcnt llill,' txhich lrrrc lrc.'rnc
..) n(!lllrn(ru\ s irh !orrtrrrscrri,rl .rnd ,rftrn illegal provl.irxts :nclktrl irr rtnd.'r tlrr' rlr.',rri.<' ,,1



nrin()r iurlcndnrcnts. As ir rcsult, thr' l liglr Court urrdcr Articlc 1 65(l)kl)(i)(ii), h:rvc so'crally

rrrlc,l rgrinst lcgislations clrricd as misccll:urc,-rus rvhcn tllcy urc strlrstantivc.

1.1.0 l;rom tlrc National Asscnrbly I'lnnsanl Rcport of May 26, 2022 (Prgc l3) thc Spcrkcr
(l lon ].8 Munrri) said thus,

"Hon. Memlxrs, lteforc u'c go to Orrlsr No.lJ, I hale .irrst looled nt thc Statrrtc Loru (Miscellnneous

Anrendmcnts) Bill, (National y'sscnrhll Bill No.26 of 2022) and I rlo not knott' wlvther tlv peoltb

rcsporuibh... Mojoriry Vhip, nrarbc, )or co d lrnd oxt. h ii (,ery xntil) tocldim to amentl 56laws

throrqh one Bill. This Horuc hru uprcsscd irsefsclcrnlll - it is a vcr; nntidt wq of going abolt it - cnl

especially ar the tail enrl o/a l)nrlianrent. Elcn though thc Bill stands commitreil to t,nriotts commillces, I

et,en do not knot, u,hich onc, bccorrsc rhcrt' arc so many lntls bting amencled. Ir loolcs likc a lwrchpotch ol

cuerything. Thc Cofrl Right [zu, l,lrich l,as lrasrcd lh( olhcr tlay is being proltosccl to be amended; a:rrrl so

is the Kenra Hunurn llights C,omrnission; tlu' Encrg Act; an/ mcnl otlurs Somebodl mlrst say rulurc

this IJill rt,orrld [,c r.'/crred ro, arrd u,ho is going to rrndcrtalr u rtquisite pfulic paticiltation bccause

lhrre are so nranlr Lrtls that ar.' l,cing nnrflklcd ... "

Sinrilirr issut's scrc otrscn,ctl in thc Nltirrrutl Assctnl'ly, llans:rrtl ltcporr Thursday' 9th May

2019 at9.30a.rn. nnd at 2.J0 p.nr rvailll'lc itt lrttl' ',' "' 1',,1,,,,, r ''; 'l rl,, r 'rr"r,l
,... rrt,lr lr',rr', I'r'.,,,, .. l,,n'.'r,l

1.3.1 lr'hny Court lindings hnlc rulcd ng;linst sul)stintivc mattcrs being amenrlcd lia thc
'omnibus' Bi s u ithin thc mcaning of tlrc u'ord 'n riscclla ncous'. On ration:rlc for
Misc,,'llancous Rills, thc lrur|osc of as u'as otrscwcd in Lau, Sociery o/ Kenya I Anothu (20|,f) c

KLR, lry thc fivc judgc bcnch is, tl thorcforc clc:rr th.t I .'th ando ll cc

rvhich i s onc ()f th(' r:tltt,.'s rnd nrincinlo sof nancc in Anicl: l0 of thc Cons lrrutrrrn.
s hich rlrlues end nrinci nlcs form thc fotrnd:rtion of otrr Statc and Nrtio Il dinA rllc t
4(2) of th.' Constirurion. omnil:rrs amcnrlmcnts in thc form of Srirtr rt.. L( isccllant'otts
Iesishdons orrrht to [lr,'confinctl onlv ro mino r nont<tnrroversill :rnal nc'ra ll h,rrr.c,kct'oint

I

nmcn nts

J.J.2 In thlt crse thc Corrrr citcd thc position in othr'r jtrrisdictions inclurling Arrstrrlil,
Canada and thc Unircd Statcs of Anre rica. 'l-hc 

nttrPosc of lvli,.c.'lhnc.'rrr: Amcrttlmr'ntr :t.

gc'ncrally acccpt.'d t-r,cn in thc jtrrisrlicritrrrs nrcrrtiont'J rlrovt'is to intrtxlrrrc minor. !on-
c()ntrovcrsial anlcndnrctrrs (rr ro rcn(.j Jl\lLEg{rllldilnr l('g[!1i14_Conrc,,1u('ntl], tlr('

intention ouglrt to be to av,rid ltavirtg nrlny snrlll scplmtc ttills rhrt scck t,,r intr.xlttcc.mall
minor :rmcndmcrrt.s ro variotts Acts. Accorrling to tlrc Crnltliln tvl isc,,'ll:r nctrr ts Stirnttr l;l!v
Amcndmcnt Progranr, firr instirncc, ftrr a Ilill ro tlrrlli[y rs r Nl iscr.lhnrrrtrs AnrcnJnrcnt it mtt.r
nor bc colltr()r'crsill, not involvc rhe s1rcnrling of Jrtrhlic frrnrlr iln(l n()t prciu(licialll lffccr thc

righn of pcrsons or sttbjt'ct r ncs chss of pcrstrrrs trr :rn cxisting offcncc.

l.1.3 The Misce llnncorrs Anlcn(lnlcnts 0ills h:rvc bccn rrs,.'tl t() intr(xhcc somc vrn'
controvcrsisl ,rnrcndnrcnr. in llu, u'hiclr is r c['rr indic:ltor thrr rhc llousr: is not acting in
gorrd t'rith crcrring J l()t of suspicion untl mistrust nrongst citizrns.

3.1.4 Tlrc p()\r cr t() lt'gislltc is tlcltgrr,:rl to rI'mrrrttically' clt-ctcd rcprc'scnt^tivr$ lry rhc pcoplc

of K!.n)'r, \\'ho hlvc ;rll rhc :ove rcign pou(r ils .rt Arriclr: l(l). That fx)ucr must tltus ltt



(.rcr':iscd in ;lccordancc s,ith drc national valtlcs and principlcs ofgovcrnancc under Articlc l0
of tht' Constinrtion and acting to the contrary is n direct violation ofthe Constinrtion.

].1.5 ln a l90l Anrcrican case of Commonwcalth rs. Barncn (199 US. l6l ) thc court stated

, "Rills- norrul^rlt' 
..11.'.1 omrrilrrrs lril ls 1:ea,l c a crvinp cvil. not onlv from thc confusion

end tlistraction of the lcgislativa mind lrv the iumblinp toqcthcr of inconsruous subiccts. l)ur
still morc bv the faciliw thcv affordcd oc rnt combinations of minorities with different

t ass o l) ld cvc

thcir scrra te mcrits". Tht' Cour t nlso notctl frrrthcr obscrvations lly l-ouis Massicottt': Thc rcal

oucsdon. how!.vcr. l'rcyond tlrc convcnicnct of rhc loycrnmcnt or of thc onnositir:n nartics.

nr:rv rvcll bc, is thc ntth ic intcrcst wcll scrvo,l lrv omnihrrs billsl Takc foI Ctrmrr cth c atrso-lrv-

USC Stu n rill as va rs fisherics m

)Surancc Antl cnvironnrcnt. it is tt rlikclv tol anlt n o,l v if rhc who lc hill s to thc

Stanrlin Commi rtcc ()n Finil tlcc..

3.3.6 Thc Misccllancorts Amctrtlmc'nt Bill, 2019 was consitlcrcrl by thc Committcc of thc

Wholc Housc of Parliamcnt irr spirc of thc nrtnrcrous Acts cu ing ncross various subjecs that

wcre undcr considcrndon. lt is inrportant to notc that Hon. T.J Kajwang, raiscd similar

conccrns on thc manncr in whiclr tlrc Misccllancorrs Amcndmcnt't Bills u'crc bcing uscr'l during

thc Parliamcnrary prcx-.'cdings ovcr tht'2019 Bill, and a nrtmber of othcr MPs agrecd that thc

Rill u'as not proper in principlc.

3.1.7 Thc Misccllancous Amcndmcnt Bill ptrrports to amcnd othcr lcgislations such :rs thc

Numcrical Machining and Kcnya Shipyard through thc Scrap Mcral Act, 201 5. That would not

only bc a subsrandvc amcndmcnt but a shortcttt and a sharp contravcntion, in lcttcr and spirit'

as cnvisagcd by thc draftcrs ofthc Constitution ofKcnya, 2010. Parliamtnt as a dury to.lcf.'nd
rhc Constirution. This it can allly do l>y loathing and conrlcmning such short ctrts an.l adhcrc

to thc lralucs cnshrincd undcr tlrc Constinrtion, us thc suprcmt' law of th.' lantl. lt also nccrl: to

rcstorc thc digniq and resJrcct to the Misct'll;rncorrs Amcndnrt'nt Rills.

.O CONCLUSION4

4.1 Thc nrost kcy rniscellancous anrcn(lmcnt trt'cdctl on thc Scr.rp Mctll Act, 2015 is thc nr:.'tl

for dclcrion of Sccrion ?(2) u'hich lras h'cn nrisus..d unrl atruscrl b1' tlrc Statc l)cpartrncnt of
Indusninlizatiorr to micrr>nranagc thc Scrap Mctnl Council (SMC) t'ct it i. a lxxly corlroritc
clpablc of suing and lr.ing suctl. Yct Scction ?(2) of rhc Ministq' 'providing sccrcrariat rcniccs'

is misconstrucd to imply tht'SMC is a tlcpartrlcnt and trr rn cxtcnsion ,,rf Statt Dt'partmcnt of
lndustrializrtion.

4.2 In linc u'irh Articlt'l(a) and 94(lX6), rhc' lcgisl:rtivt aurhorir) ofrhc Rtpublic is tlcrivcd
from thc pcopL' (antl not Srarc officcrs) and al rhc national l*cl is rcstcd in and urcrciscrl lry
Parliament. Any pcrson and or enrity ancmnring to circumvcnt provisinns of this law arc

cnqaging on a ncasonablc offencc.

4.3 ln conclusion thcrefort', uc hopc that tlrc Houee can inrqluce lxttcr mcchanirmr to sis<:

and anr'st carcls riding on and maliciously alrusing the Mirellancour Amcndmcnt Rillr whiclr
sr'n'c u crirical purptrsc I



?

I

,

i,

t

7

,,rl n,k fon+rtrtl ro yulr cnrly mld favourablc rcsponsc. Thank you,

ti'lrrs sinccrcly
FED NOTKBNYA(COFEK)&

cn Mumm

Ms Rcbctce Mlano
Cabinct Secrctary
Mlnlstry of Invcstments, Trade snd lndustry
NSSF Block A . l?,r Floor
NAIROBT

Hon Justin B. Muturi
Attomc"y Gcncral
Anomey Gcneral Chambcro

Sheria Housc
NAIROBI

DrJume Mukhwana
Principd Sccrcary
Statc Depattncnt of IndusttY

NSSF Block A- l7a Floor

NAIROBI

Mr Prancls Mugo
Chalrmen
Scrap Metel Council
NSSF Block A, 23d Floor

NAIROBI



t

MINI'TRY CIT IN\,C'TMINT' TTAI)E ^xo 
lNouSrtY

()rrd d fr* C.M hdt ..l

Ll., b
Utr.r,-

lL,rr'-

Copy lo:

J!(.

J

*.nH*
R,.t No. MlrurDvl/aa t)..? l2' ,.rtrEry' 20'
Mr. 

'.rnrr.l 
Nro.o!r. <tt

<1..& ol thc N.rlo.ul Art. rrblY
P.rllrnl.nl gurtdin8

AiIENDME \rrt TO THE SCRJ\P META ACT

Thc aboe(. n mrd .m.nd.netltt <.mr vP ln ihc N'llo'n't Ar"rnblY lor ltla

nrrl Edi.8 ln No\r.tnb.r. 2O2,'

tubrrquer,aly. t v?61 mcdlntt wcr' Gonr'lrEd lo ldcntttY l$r'ct th{
n rr.tr., to b€ adda?,tad'

caL

?

The Mlnitlrv ol lnv.llmentr' TEdG' tnd lndutlry h'r gt'ttltrhld lh't ttr€rt

,:'::;';l;;:;'i *iaa, o" th" i'tuc' <orircqucntlv' thir It ro rcqrFn

;;1',;"p.l;il "i'ini' 
lrrr b€ pur on hllr uotll lunhet notkr'

,.ffi{:l"rn,,". ro'
CAEIIIE_'EBEA&Y

,uma Mukhwrnr. PhD. CBS

Prln€lpal Secretary

,tate DePsdmsrt fot lndu'try
Nairobi

t

?o
CLI

[ ^..,

.-- le ,.

I,L
:1iu...

fL l^...(.
..-....,',.,1k''

flYu
I

.J

a ].117


